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IFS Cloud™ – 
Construction module

The IFS Cloud construction module enables 
organisations to manage complex projects, assets, 
and contracts across the entire construction 
lifecycle. From design and engineering through to 
execution, commissioning, and maintenance, IFS 
provides a unified platform that improves 
efficiency, profitability, and compliance.

IFS is a recognised leader in project and 
asset-based ERP. Trusted by global construction 
firms such as Clancy Docwra, Berkeley Group, and 
NCC, IFS delivers functionality for project 
management, contract control, and field service. 
With IFS, construction companies can deliver 
projects on time, on budget, and to the highest 
quality standards.

Platned is an IFS Gold Services Partner with 
extensive experience in delivering ERP 
transformation for construction and engineering 
organisations. Our expertise spans the full project 
lifecycle – from business case and solution design 
to implementation, hosting, and 24/7 support. We 
align technology with your people and processes to 
deliver measurable outcomes. As trusted advisors, 
we focus on building long-term partnerships that 
deliver sustained business value.

Clancy Docwra – Leading UK utilities and 
construction service provider using IFS for project 
management, work order control, and asset 
maintenance
Berkeley Group – Major UK residential property 
developer leveraging IFS to manage projects, 
contracts, and financials with full visibility

• Improve project profitability with accurate 
forecasting, budgeting, and billing

• Reduce delays by optimising workforce, 
subcontractor, and equipment utilisation

• Enhance compliance through centralised project 
documentation and quality assurance

• Streamline collaboration across stakeholders with 
integrated workflows and mobile access

• Increase visibility across the project portfolio with 
real-time dashboards

• Support business growth with a scalable platform 
for multi-project, multi-site, and international 
operations

• Project and contract management – integrated 
tools for planning, execution, and monitoring 
with real-time cost control

• Resource and workforce planning – optimise 
labour, subcontractors, and equipment 
allocation across multiple projects

• Document management – centralised control of 
drawings, specifications, and compliance 
documentation

• Cost and revenue control – track budgets, 
change orders, and billing with complete 
visibility

• Asset lifecycle management – manage 
construction assets from procurement through 
operation and maintenance

• Mobile and field capabilities – real-time updates 
from site for progress tracking, safety reporting, 
and quality checks
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